
US CAPITAL – PAMP EA Powered
Applies to all clients using our Prop Firm Account Management Program

SECTION 1: ACCOUNT & SERVICE RULES

1.1 – One Subscription = One Account

Each PAMP subscription covers one (1) prop firm account only. 
Submitting multiple accounts under the same plan is not allowed.

1.2 – Valid Account Ownership

Only accounts personally owned by the client are accepted. Submitting 
accounts that belong to third parties or unknown individuals is strictly 
forbidden.

1.3 – Prop Firm Must Be Supported

The submitted account must belong to a supported prop firm (e.g., 
FundedNext, FTMO,, TFT, etc.). We do not support accounts from 
banned or unverified platforms.

1.4 – Login Credentials Must Be Accurate

All login details provided (MT4/MT5, investor password, server, platform 
type) must be correct. Invalid or missing credentials delay or cancel 
service activation.

1.5 – No Manual Trading

Once the EA is connected to your account, manual trading is strictly 
prohibited. Interfering with trades will result in account disqualification.



1.6 – No EA Tampering

Clients must not attempt to:

• Modify EA settings

• Disconnect or restart the EA

• Use third-party software to interfere with the system

1.7 – No Password Changes During Active Period

Changing your account password without notifying the team will cause 
disconnection and service interruption.

1.8 – Account Type Must Be Challenge or Funded

PAMP is only designed for challenge or funded accounts — not demo 
accounts or personal live trading accounts.

SECTION 2: BEHAVIOR & ETHICS

2.1 – Respect the Team

All communication with the US CAPITAL team must remain professional. 
Any form of aggression, insult, or disrespect results in immediate 
disqualification.

2.2 – Stay Available

Clients must respond to emails, Telegram messages or form requests 
within 7 days. Non-responsive accounts may be paused or removed.

2.3 – No Spamming or Self-Promotion

Advertising, spamming or posting external offers in our Telegram or 
Discord communities is not allowed.



2.4 – Private Service Access Only

Do not share your access (forms, documents, strategies, credentials) 
with anyone. This service is confidential and private.

2.5 – Clear Communication Required

Use proper language when submitting information. Avoid vague answers 
or incomplete messages that delay your activation.

SECTION 3: PAYOUT & PROFIT SHARING

3.1 – Mandatory Payout to US CAPITAL

All payouts must be sent to our crypto wallet (USDT/BTC) as instructed. 
The 50/50 profit split is non-negotiable.

3.2 – No Direct Withdrawals

The client cannot receive the payout directly without prior arrangement. 
If it happens, they must send 50% immediately.

3.3 – Delayed or Blocked Payouts

If the prop firm delays the payout, we wait together. If they block it, we 
cannot be held responsible.

3.4 – Payout Fraud = Permanent Ban

Attempting to withhold or hide profits will result in:

• Permanent blacklist

• Removal from all US CAPITAL services

• No future access to our bots, teams or updates



SECTION 4: VIOLATIONS & TERMINATION

4.1 – Breach of Rules

Any violation of the above rules may result in:

• Termination of service

• Loss of client rights

• Ban from our communities

4.2 – Repeat Offenders

Clients who repeatedly ignore rules will be banned permanently, 
regardless of previous payments.

4.3 – Refunds Will Not Be Issued

Violation = no refund. All payments are final, as stated in our Terms & 
Conditions.

4.4 – Legal Action

Severe abuse, fraud or identity theft may result in legal pursuit under 
UAE jurisdiction.

SECTION 5: FINAL NOTES

5.1 – You Accept These Rules By Joining

Whether you read them or not, once you subscribe or submit your 
account, you agree to these rules in full.

5.2 – Updates



Rules may be updated at any time. The latest version is always available 
on our official website or Telegram.

US CAPITAL Inc.

We build trust through discipline and transparency.


